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Matsumoto (2012) noted that programs to be prepared concerning emotional literacy have a positive impact on the 
prevention of children and adolescents from dropping school. Another group of researchers emphasize that emotional 
literacy skills influence students’ academic skills, friend relationships, mental health, social skills, forming good 
attitudes towards school, self-concept etc. positively (Antidote, 2003; Kandemir & Dündar, 2008). Furthermore, there 
are some other researches focusing on adults rather than children or adolescents arguing that emotional literacy is 
connected with coping behavior, self-efficacy, general and emotional wellbeing (Chan, 2008; Adeyemo, 2007; Carmeli, 
Yitzhak‐Halevy, & Weisberg, 2009). It can be concluded that besides emotional literacy plays a key role in order to 
avoid mental health problems (Killick, 2006) it is also a significant factor to build and maintain a healthy interpersonal 
communication. Consequently, it can be drawn that studies regarding emotional literacy have an outstanding position in 
terms of preventive and protective psychological counseling and guidance services. 

Measuring emotional literacy correctly is an important part of the process. It was observed that in literature, emotional 
intelligence scales were often used in order to identify the emotional literacy levels, to investigate the relations between 
emotional literacy and various psychological variables and also to test the efficiency of psychoeducational programs 
aiming to enhance emotional literacy (e.g.; Bar-On Emotional Intelligence Quotient Inventory, Mayer Slovey Caruso 
Emotional Intelligence Scale) while scales measuring emotional literacy were happened to be quite limited. So as to 
assess emotional literacy, some researchers use checklists (Mann, 2014) while some prefer developing a scale. Suhaily 
and Riah (2004) choose to develop a scale whose main goal is to measure middle-school students’ emotional literacy 
levels. This scale comprises of five sub-dimensions which are self-regulation, internal motivation, social skill, empathy 
and self-awareness (Cited by Kandemir & Dündar, 2008). A recent study by Palancı, Kandemir, Dündar and Özpolat 
(2014) presents another emotional literacy scale which has three sub-dimensions; self-regulation, emotional awareness 
and social skill. It can be noted that those scales are designed to be used in school environments for students and 
consists of items based on educational environment and learning processes. On the other hand, in this study, the aim is 
to develop a Likert scale which measures young adults’ and adults’ emotional literacy on the basis of the five 
fundamental skills suggestions (being aware of one’s own emotions, being able to empathize sincerely, knowing how to 
manage emotions, being able to restore emotional damage and being able to develop emotional interaction) made by 
Steiner (2003) whose field of work is about developing emotional literacy in the lights of interpersonal relationships 
arising from love. This scale is considered to be useful for the field both for descriptive and experimental researches 
regarding emotional literacy. 

2. Method 

2.1 Participants and Procedures 

As a very first step of scale development, literature regarding emotional literacy was studied in order to generate items. 
Afterwards, a composition study was held with a group of experts in the field of psychological counseling (n=25) in 
order to identify the must-have characteristics concerning emotional literacy. As a result of both of these studies, 58 
items were generated in a way that items involved all dimensions of emotional literacy. Items that were generated were 
firstly presented to the experts in the field of psychological counseling (n=7) to be analyzed in terms of content, clarity 
and expression similarities. After the intended changes were made in accordance with the experts’ opinions, there left 52 
statements; 34 of which presenting high tendency (+) while 18 of which presenting low tendency (-).  

Initial form was applied to 281 students who were receiving education in a state university at the Marmara Region in 
Turkey in 2014-2015 academic year. Nine students who failed to complete the initial form as asked were excluded from 
the research. This study, in conclusion, was administered with 272 students. 

In an attempt to analyze data and form the final scale, item analysis based upon item scale correlation and mean 
differences between groups and explanatory factor analysis were conducted. Items considered to be qualified according 
to these three techniques results were selected to the final form. 

Final form was applied to 358 students who were receiving education in a state university at the Marmara Region in 
Turkey in 2014-2015 academic year. Students who failed to complete the final form as asked (n=3) and who could not 
meet the assumptions of confirmatory factor analysis (n=10) were discarded from the research. This study was 
administered with 345 participants. 

3. Findings 

3.1 Item Analysis Based upon Item Scale Correlation 

Table 1 shows correlation coefficients of item scores with total score of the scale. 
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Table 1. Item Analysis Results Based Upon Item Scale Correlation 

Items 1* 2* 3* 4* 5* 6* 7* 8* 9* 10* 

r 0.507 0.487 0.264 0.560 0.299 0.462 0.428 0.330 0.478 0.520 

Items  11* 12* 13* 14* 15* 16* 17* 18* 19* 20* 

r 0.471 0.484 0.554 0.532 0.495 0.340 0.389 0.485 0.413 0.301 

Items  21* 22* 23* 24* 25** 26* 27* 28* 29* 30* 

r 0.286 0.392 0.487 0.458 0.127 0.422 0.360 0.582 0.193 0.237 

Items 31* 32* 33* 34* 35* 36* 37* 38* 39* 40* 

r 0.464 0.146 0.344 0.334 0.224 0.157 0.459 0.513 0.406 0.416 

Items  41* 42* 43* 44* 45* 46* 47* 48* 49* 50* 

r 0.246 0.400 0.463 0.424 0.411 0.457 0.388 0.391 0.460 0.467 

Items 51* 52*         

r 0.303 0.318         

p< 0.01*, p< 0.05** 

It can be interpreted from the Table 1 that all items in the scale measure the same construct as overall scale does. Hence, 
items which were utilized in the initial form are qualified enough to be a part of the final scale. 

3.2 Item Analysis Based upon Mean Differences between Groups  
Scores which were obtained from students’ answer were ranked in a descending order. 73 students who had the lowest 
scores were grouped as the lower and 73 who had the highest scores were assigned to the higher group. Afterwards, the 
mean score difference for each item between the lower and the higher groups were analyzed with independent samples 
t-test. The results are as shown in Table 2. 

Table 2. Item Analysis Results Based Upon Mean Differences between Groups  

Items 1* 2* 3* 4* 5* 6* 7* 8* 9* 10* 

t 53.655 42.228 33.908 34.294 43.624 53.129 23.976 25.783 48.739 34.913 

Items  11* 12* 13* 14* 15* 16* 17* 18* 19* 20* 

t 43.102 45.025 41.828 62.138 49.350 52.881 64.750 45.694 24.667 49.040 

Items 21* 22* 23* 24* 25** 26* 27* 28* 29* 30* 

t 24.309 33.344 45.705 58.601 67.772 47.915 39.205 46.757 48.917 34.759 

Items  31* 32* 33* 34* 35* 36* 37* 38* 39* 40* 

t 61.921 34.847 28.097 49.395 46.300 40.061 48.198 37.216 34.674 41.296 

Items  41* 42* 43* 44* 45* 46* 47* 48* 49* 50* 

t 24.627 26.536 64.804 50.165 27.933 63.275 43.958 39.215 40.756 54.727 

Items 51* 52*         

t 47.348 43.741         

p< 0.01**, p< 0.05*  

Table 2 shows that each item on the scale is sufficient enough to discriminate between people who have the feature 
which is aimed to be measured by this item and who have not. Therefore, items which were utilized in the initial form 
are qualified enough to be a part of the final scale. 

3.3 Factor Analysis 

In order to decide if the data gathered from the initial form was appropriate for factor analysis, Kaiser-Meyer-Olkin 
(KMO) and Bartlett’s Test of Sphericity were conducted. Results are as shown in Table 3. 
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emotions’ (e.g. “I do not hesitate to show my reaction when I am angry.”, “Working under extensive pressure and stress 
does not affect my productivity (performance) thanks to my being nonchalant”). Table 5 shows the dimension and factor 
loadings of items. 

Table 5. Dimensions and Factor Loadings of Items  

 Sub-dimensions

Items 1 2 3 4 5

i1 0.791 

i2 0.769 

i6 0.733 

i18 0.663 

i21 0.573 

i28 0.515 

i34 0.503 

i23 0.493 

i15 0.437 

i29 0.722

i7 0.694

i12 0.630

i35 0.623

i14 0.581

i19 0.533

i22 0.517

i24 0.503

i33 0.417

i2 0.402

i8  0.806

i32 0.695

i13 0.583

i25 0.482

i3 0.347

i16 0.700 

i9 0.659 

i4 0.641 

i20 0.520 

i31 0.479 

i26 0.423 

i10 0.740

i27 0.635

i5 0.603

i17 0.481

i30 0.344

3.3.2 Confirmatory Factor Analysis (CFA) 
Confirmatory factor analysis was conducted with LISREL 8.37 package program. Confirmatory factor analysis results 
reveal that all the items are statistically significant at 0.05 level meaning that all items (observed variables) are 
representing their latent variable except from item 10 under the fifth dimension. Critical value (1.96) is greater than t 
value calculated for item 10. Therefore, it is considered that this item failed to present its latent variable, as a result, was 
discarded from the model. Items (n=34) factored under five dimensions were re-analyzed. 

Fit indexes calculated in this study are as shown in Table 6. 
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Table 6. Emotional Literacy Scale Measurement Model Fit Indexes 

Fit Index Statistics Values 

Degrees of Freedom (df) 542 

Chi-Square (X2) 1043.73 

X2/df 1.93 

Root Mean Square Error of Approximation (RMSEA) 0.052 

Comparative Fit Index (CFI)  0.89 

Goodness of Fit Index (GFI)  0.85 

Adjusted Goodness of Fit Index (AGFI)  0.83 

The ratio of chi square with degree of freedom is 1043.73/542 = 1.93. This value proves that there is excellent fit 
(Tabachnick & Fidel, 2001) between the original variable matrix and the suggested matrix. RMSEA value which was 
calculated as 0.052 shows good fit for the measurement model (Hu & Bentler, 1999). However, CFI fit index which was 
0.89 suggests a weak but yet non-negligible fit as the value is smaller than the critical value. GFI and AGFI fit indexes 
are respectively 0.85 and 0.83. Even though GFI and AGFI values are below the acceptable interval, GFI being greater 
than 0.85 and AGFI being greater than 0.80 propose that fit indexes are at the lower limits of model acceptance 
(Anderson & Gerbing, 1984; Cole, 1987; Marsh, Balla & McDonald, 1988 cited by Duyan & Gelbal, 2008; 
Schermelleh-Engel, Moosbrugger & Müller, 2003). 

When the obtained values were compared with expected critical values, it is clear that values obtained from this study 
are in acceptable interval. Based on this result, it can be concluded that each factor presents the statements. 

3.4 Reliability of the Scale 

Cronbach alpha reliability coefficient of the scale for the first factor is 0.75; for the second factor is 0.73; for the third 
factor is 0.71; for the fourth factor is 0.71 and for the fifth factor is 0.72. Reliability coefficient for overall scale was 
calculated as 0.80. In order to figure out the test-retest validity, final form was administered to 45 people twice in 15 
days’ time. The correlation between the administrations were calculated. According to the results, the correlation for the 
first factor is 0.71; for the second factor is 0.76; for the third factor is 0.73; for the fourth factor is 0.75 and for the fifth 
factor is 0.78. Validity coefficient for overall scale was determined as 0.89. This value acknowledges that the scale 
produces consistent results. Those findings support that the scale has a satisfactory level of reliability. 

4. Discussion and Conclusion 

The scale which was developed in this study and named as Emotional Literacy Scale contains “emotional awareness”, 
“social competence”, “understanding emotions”, “emotional self-efficacy” and “regulating emotions” sub-dimensions 
and 34 items. In the lights of the obtained findings, it can be concluded that Emotional Literacy Scale is a valid and 
reliable measurement tool. According to the explanatory and confirmatory factor analysis results, Emotional Literacy 
Scale is a multi-dimensional scale. This situation is consistent with the theoretical descriptions of emotional literacy in 
literature and also is similar with the existing scales presenting multidimensional constructs (Steiner, 2003; Mann, 2014; 
Palancı et al., 2014). 

This scale can be used for the researches which are designed for young adults and adults to investigate the relationship 
between emotional literacy and various variables and also to test the psychoeducational programs which are developed 
to enhance emotional literacy. As it is developed in order to measure the young adults’ and adults’ emotional literacy 
skills, it is also suggested that appropriate versions of the scale for different age groups should be developed. 
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